



RFQ 17-016

VMWare

Friday, Decemeberh 02, 2016 3:00 p.m.

Vendor	CDWG	Directec	GovConnection	SHI	Tiger Direct
60 each- Enterprise to Enterprise Plus Upgrade VS6-ENT-EPL-UG-APRO	\$9,861.00	<b>N O B i d</b>	\$10,775.40	No Bid	\$10,821.60
60 each - Enterprise Plus 1 year Support VS6-EPL-P-SSS-A	\$50,206.80		\$57,028.30	No Bid	\$49,093.20
10 each - Standard to Enterprise Plus Upgrade VS6-STD-EPL-UG-A	\$13,292.90		\$14,525.90	No Bid	\$14,588.80
10 each - Enterprise Plus 1 year Support VS6-EPL-P-SSS-A	\$8,367.80			No Bid	\$9,097.30
1 each - vCenter Basic Support VCS6-STD-G-SSS-C-R	\$1,211.26		\$1,162.88	\$1,184.00	No Bid
1 each - vCenter Production Support VCS6-STD-P-SSS-A-R	\$1,446.16		\$1,384.55	\$1,409.00	No Bid
1 each - Site Recovery Manager Production Support VC-SRM6-25S-P-SSS-A	\$1,172.77		\$1,125.93	\$1,146.00	\$1,141.21
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$85,558.69</b>			<b>\$86,002.96</b>	<b>\$3,739.00</b>

Received and Opened by: