



ITB 17-031
LAWN CARE AND LANDSCAPING SERVICE
 Thursday, August 10, 2017 2:00 p.m.

| VENDOR | Terry's Lawn Care AWARD | | | | Power N Go | | | | Qualityscape | Gulf Coast Contractors | Lawn Love |
|--|--|-------------|-----------------|--------------|--------------------------------------|-------------|-----------------|--------------|---------------|------------------------|---------------|
| Specs/Requirements | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Original with digital copy | Yes | | | | Yes | | | | | | |
| HUB: Yes/No | No | | | | Yes | | | | | | |
| Attachments A, C, D, E | Yes | | | | Yes | | | | | | |
| Addendum(s) | Yes | | | | Yes | | | | | | |
| Lawn Care: Yrs in Business | 30 | | | | 5 | | | | | | |
| No. Employees/No. Vehicles Included equipment list | No. Emp: 17; No. Vehicles 10; Included | | | | No. Emp: 5; No. Vehicles 2; Included | | | | | | |
| Pricing by Location: | Wk/Mo Monthly | Semi-Annual | Average Monthly | Total Annual | Wk/Mo Monthly | Semi-Annual | Average Monthly | Total Annual | | | |
| Builder Rd. 2200 | \$250.00 | \$60.00 | \$225.00 | \$3,060.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| California 2812 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Cibolo 3704 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Diaz 4833 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| East Lancaster 1350 | \$85.00 | \$60.00 | \$90.00 | \$1,080.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| El Paso 1501 | \$325.00 | \$150.00 | \$377.50 | \$4,050.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Fenton 3829 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Harmon Rd 129 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Hemphill 1527 | \$400.00 | \$250.00 | \$420.83 | \$5,050.00 | \$869.47 | \$2,000.00 | \$895.66 | \$12,433.64 | | | |
| Hulen 3800 | \$366.00 | \$160.00 | \$379.33 | \$4,552.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Hulen 3840 | \$415.00 | \$450.00 | \$452.50 | \$5,430.00 | \$869.47 | \$2,000.00 | \$895.66 | \$12,433.64 | | | |
| Jennings 507 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Juneau Road 6341 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Kingswood 6312 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Lovell 5325 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Martha Lane 7224 | \$140.00 | \$60.00 | \$145.00 | \$1,740.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Meaders 2620 | \$325.00 | \$150.00 | \$337.50 | \$4,050.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| NW 24th Street 2400 | \$270.00 | \$60.00 | \$275.00 | \$3,300.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Pennsylvania 300 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Pipeline 1619 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Racquet Club 4809 | \$250.00 | \$60.00 | \$255.00 | \$3,060.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Rock Springs 6305 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Sage Hill 7500 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Sandy Lane 701 | \$250.00 | \$60.00 | \$255.00 | \$3,060.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Shamrock 3313 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Slate 5208-5210 | \$100.00 | \$30.00 | \$102.50 | \$1,230.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |

| Pricing by Location: | Wk/Mo Monthly | Semi-Annual | Average Monthly | Total Annual | Wk/Mo Monthly | Semi-Annual | Average Monthly | Total Annual | | | |
|------------------------------|----------------------------------|-------------------|-------------------|--------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------------|---------------------|---------------|---------------|---------------|
| South Hulen 6225 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| South Jennings 815 | \$85.00 | \$60.00 | \$90.00 | \$1,080.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Summit Ave. 1301 | \$140.00 | \$60.00 | \$145.00 | \$1,740.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Summit Ave. 1319 | \$60.00 | \$20.00 | \$61.67 | \$740.00 | \$869.47 | \$2,000.00 | \$895.66 | \$12,433.64 | | | |
| Waco Way 6108 | \$100.00 | \$30.00 | \$102.50 | \$1,230.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| West 4th St. 3136 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| West Lane 1005 | \$140.00 | \$60.00 | \$145.00 | \$1,740.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Williams Rd. 1136 | \$250.00 | \$60.00 | \$255.00 | \$3,060.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Worrell 5682 | \$125.00 | \$60.00 | \$130.00 | \$1,560.00 | \$869.47 | \$156.25 | \$895.66 | \$10,589.86 | | | |
| Total Bid Lawn Care | \$6,076.00 | \$2,860.00 | \$6,324.33 | \$75,772.00 | \$30,431.45 | \$11,000.00 | \$31,348.10 | \$376,176.44 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Landscaping: Yrs in Business | 30 | | | | 5 | | | | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Hourly Labor Rates: Position | General Landscaper: \$75.00/hour | | | | Landscape Supervisor: \$36.63/hour | | | | | | |
| | | | | | Landscape Technician: \$33.08/hour | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Materials Mark-Up | 20% | | | | 10% | | | | | | |

Received and Opened by: Heather Carmichael, Purchasing Assistant; Terri buehler, Purchasing Agent

NEXT LOW: _____
LOW: _____
SAVINGS: _____
AWARD DATE: _____

"Bid Tabulation Statement"

All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive. MHMR will make a determination as to the responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The Agency will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.