



RFP 18-007
Transportation Services
Thursday, June 7, 2018 2:00 p.m.

VENDOR		First Light				Irving Holdings				Real Time Transport				Ride N Safe																																																						
Part 1: Non-Emergency																																																																				
1. Tarrant County		1 way				see Other Costs				all trips based on mileage				\$30.00				Mode of Transport Fee + \$3.00/mi																																																		
		Round Trip				see Other Costs				all trips based on mileage				\$60.00				Mode of Transport Fee + \$3.00/mi																																																		
		Other Costs				\$.85/mile + \$30.00/hour				See Notes Below				Included Addendum																																																						
2. Additional Counties		One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County																																																			
Cooke						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				No Bid																																																						
Dallas						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Denton						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Ellis						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Erath						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Hood						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Johnson						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Navarro						Not Applicable				\$30.00	\$60.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Palo Pinto						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Parker						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Somervell						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above																																																						
Wise						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				No Bid																																																						
3. SOLO Trips		One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County																																																			
Tarrant						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	See Below*	\$30.00	as above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Cooke						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				No Bid																																																						
Dallas						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	See Below*	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Denton						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	See Below*	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Ellis						See Below				\$30.00	\$60.00	See Below*	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Erath						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Hood						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Johnson						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Navarro						Not Applicable				\$30.00	\$60.00	See Below*	\$30.00	No Bid																																																						
Palo Pinto						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Parker						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Somervell						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				As Above	as above	see Addendum																																																				
Wise						Not Applicable				No Proposed Service				No Bid																																																						
4. Extended Boarding		\$15.00								\$0.00				N/A																																																						
5. Other																																																																				
Discount: more than 2 pass		N/A				2nd Passenger \$2.00 if p/u & drop are same				\$0.00				N/A																																																						
Minimum/Maximum Number Pass		Maximum 3 passengers (1 patient)				based on size of vehicle				None: can provide multiple vehicles if necessary				1 minimum/ 2 maximum																																																						
Part 2: On-Demand																																																																				
1. Tarrant County		1 way				\$62.00/hour + \$.85/mile				all trips based on mileage				NO BID																																																						
		Round Trip				\$62.00/hour + \$.85/mile				all trips based on mileage																																																										
		Other Costs				N/A								NO BID																																																						
2. Additional Counties		One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County	One Way	Round Trip	Other Costs	Outside County																																																			
Dallas						See Below				NO BID				NO BID																																																						
Denton						See Below																																																														
Ellis						See Below				NO BID				NO BID																																																						
Johnson						Not Applicable																																																														
Parker						Not Applicable				NO BID				NO BID																																																						
Other Costs		N/A																																																																		
3. Other																																																																				
Discount: more than 2 pass		N/A				2nd Passenger \$2.00 if p/u & drop are same				NO BID				NO BID																																																						
Minimum/Maximum Number Pass		Maximum 3 passengers (1 patient)				limited based on size of vehicle				NO BID				NO BID																																																						
Notes						<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>One way trip calculation</th> <th>Tarrant</th> <th>Dallas</th> <th>Denton</th> <th>Ellis</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Drop Charge (to enter a taxi cab)</td> <td>\$2.25</td> <td>\$2.25</td> <td>\$2.25</td> <td>\$2.25</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Each 1/9th of a mile</td> <td>\$0.20</td> <td>\$0.20</td> <td>\$0.20</td> <td>\$0.20</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Waiting (per 90 seconds)</td> <td>\$0.45</td> <td>\$0.45</td> <td>\$0.45</td> <td>\$0.45</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Extra passenger</td> <td>\$2.00</td> <td>\$2.00</td> <td>\$2.00</td> <td>\$2.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Minimum Charge ambulatory</td> <td>\$12.00</td> <td>\$12.00</td> <td>\$25.00</td> <td>\$25.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Minimum Charge non-ambulatory</td> <td>\$16.00</td> <td>\$16.00</td> <td>\$30.00</td> <td>\$30.00</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>				One way trip calculation	Tarrant	Dallas	Denton	Ellis	Drop Charge (to enter a taxi cab)	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25	Each 1/9th of a mile	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20	Waiting (per 90 seconds)	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$0.45	Extra passenger	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	Minimum Charge ambulatory	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	Minimum Charge non-ambulatory	\$16.00	\$16.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	<p>*Price per: Regular van: \$30; Wheelchair Van: \$36; Per Round trip: each leg fare same as one-way; Per Add stop: add one-way trip fee; 20% Premium outside norm bus hours; Cross county (outside Tarrant) add \$30 per trip; Trips cross more than 2 counties, add \$30 per county crossed</p>				<table border="1"> <tbody> <tr> <td>Ambulatory/Walker-Assist</td> <td>\$20.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Round-trip Ambulatory/Walker-Assist</td> <td>\$30.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Wheelchair</td> <td>\$45.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Round-trip Wheelchair</td> <td>\$65.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport</td> <td>\$75.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Round-trip Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport</td> <td>\$110.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Oxygen Usage</td> <td>\$20.00 (2-4Lpm) - \$10.00 (5-6Lpm)</td> </tr> <tr> <td>*Oxygen over 1-hour, continuous</td> <td>Additional \$35.00 minimum</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>				Ambulatory/Walker-Assist	\$20.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Round-trip Ambulatory/Walker-Assist	\$30.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Wheelchair	\$45.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Round-trip Wheelchair	\$65.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport	\$75.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Round-trip Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport	\$110.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)	Oxygen Usage	\$20.00 (2-4Lpm) - \$10.00 (5-6Lpm)	*Oxygen over 1-hour, continuous	Additional \$35.00 minimum
One way trip calculation	Tarrant	Dallas	Denton	Ellis																																																																
Drop Charge (to enter a taxi cab)	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25																																																																
Each 1/9th of a mile	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20																																																																
Waiting (per 90 seconds)	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$0.45																																																																
Extra passenger	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00																																																																
Minimum Charge ambulatory	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$25.00	\$25.00																																																																
Minimum Charge non-ambulatory	\$16.00	\$16.00	\$30.00	\$30.00																																																																
Ambulatory/Walker-Assist	\$20.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Round-trip Ambulatory/Walker-Assist	\$30.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Wheelchair	\$45.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Round-trip Wheelchair	\$65.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport	\$75.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Round-trip Reclining-Stretcher Chair Transport	\$110.00 + \$3.00 per mile (while PT is in vehicle)																																																																			
Oxygen Usage	\$20.00 (2-4Lpm) - \$10.00 (5-6Lpm)																																																																			
*Oxygen over 1-hour, continuous	Additional \$35.00 minimum																																																																			