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WE CHANGE LIVES

ITB 24-007

Printing Materials and Promotional Items

Thursday, 03/21/2024

VENDOR Just Right Products Ecoimprint Allmark Pressman Printing Inc.] Thomas Printworks Be Business
Specs/Requirements
Printing Services Primary Alternate Secondary
Mininmum order requirements YES NO BID Depends NO Yes NO
Volume discount offered NO NO BID YES NO Yes YES
Business/ Appointment NO BID NO BID $23.00 $50.00 $61.67 $30.50
Cards, 16pt.
Business/ Appointment ., NO BID NO BID $28.00 $60.00 $68.75 $36.50
Cards, 16pt.
Business/ Appointment ;0 NO BID NO BID $37.00 $75.00 $81.33 $42.50
Cards, 16pt.
Business/ Appointment , o) NO BID NO BID $60.00 $256.49 $176.67 $75.50
Cards, 16pt.
Business/ Appointment o ;) NO BID NO BID $99.00 $368.13 $262.50 $136.50
Cards, 16pt.
4 x 6 Post card 1,000 NO BID NO BID $65.00 $224.25 $170.83 $69.00
5 x 7 Comment card 1,000 NO BID NO BID $99.00 $308.89 $220.83 $112.50
4 Color85x 11 Trifold ) 9, NO BID NO BID $160.00 $436.67 $472.50 $161.89
Brochures
4 Color 4.5 x 11 Trifold ) NO BID NO BID $175.00 $341.54 $293.33 $320.00
Brochures
2” x 10” Name plate EA NO BID NO BID $9.00 $17.63 $18.93 $12.00
27x10 Eiﬁeeflate with e NO BID NO BID $16.95 $17.33 $39.21 $19.00
$102.83
Foamcore Board 11 x 17 EA NO BID NO BID $18.00 . $17.00 $15.00
$15 Delivery Fee
Foamcore Board 16 x20  EA NO BID NO BID $23.00 $104.96 $25.50 $22.00
$15 Delivery Fee
Foamcore Board 18 x 24  EA NO BID NO BID $28.00 CLGLE $25.50 $32.00
$15 Delivery Fee
Foamcore Board 22 x28  EA NO BID NO BID $32.00 $108.27 $42.50 $42.00
$15 Delivery Fee

https://wechangelives.sharepoint.com/sites/Purchasing-Team/Shared Documents/General/PUR-Teams/BIDS/2024/24-007 Printing Materials and Promotional
Last Updated 6/14/2014

Items/Tab 2/Tab. Drafts/Copy of 24-007 Pritning Service Bid Tabulation draft 3.xls




Stamps Self inking 1/2” x

2-1/8” EA NO BID NO BID $15.95 $18.95 NO BID $18.00
Stamps Sez'g?;,'”g BTX A NO BID NO BID $16.95 $18.95 NO BID $21.50
Stamps Standard 1/2” x 2- $6.25
/87 EA NO BID NO BID $3.95-ink pad $18.95 NO BID $5.50
Stamps Standard 7/8" X 2- $10.00
3/8" EA NO BID NO BID $3.95-ink pad $18.95 NO BID $9.50
Lamination Service EA NO BID NO BID N/A $25.00 $4.00/sq.ft. per side $4.00/sq.ft.
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS Alternate Secondary Primary
VENDOR Just Right Products Ecoimprint Allmark Pressman Printing Inc.|] Thomas Printworks Be Business
Women's Collar Shirt EA $14'90 S_XIT_ $19.00 - 12ct/min $19.50 EA $24.95-$27.96 EA $12.82 $18.00 - 12ct/min
Extended sizes additional
. - $14.90 S-XL . .
Men's Colar Shirt EA . - $19.00 - 12ct/min $19.50 EA $24.95-$27.97 EA $16.79 $18.00 - 12ct/min
Extended sizes additional
. $7.60 S-XL . .
T-Shirt EA . " $17.00 - 12ct/min $12.00 EA $11.27- $13.27 EA $13.55 $9.50 - 12ct/min
Extended sizes additional
. $36.90 S-XL . .
Zip-up Jacket EA . - $75.00 - 12ct/min $34- $38 EA $41.85- $44.85 EA $77.64 $35.00 - 12ct/min
Extended sizes additional
Badge Holder Reel EA $4.69 - 250ct/min. $.66 - 500ct/min $2.45 - 1000ct/min $2.46 NO BID $1.90 - 250ct/min
Key Chain EA $0.48 - 500ct/min. $1.03 - 500ct/min $1.74 - 300ct/min $1.09 $1.20 $1.20 - 300ct/min
Power Bank EA $7.93 - 50ct/min $9.41 - 100ct/min $8.00 - 50ct/min $9.55 $6.40 $8.50 - 50ct/min
MHMR Lunch Tote EA $25.15 - 25c¢t/min $2.99 - 100ct/min $8.24 - 60ct/min $6.63 $2.20 $7.25 - 75ct/min
3x5 Note Pad-50 pages EA $1.62 - 250ct/min $1.49 - 500ct/min $2.00 - 500ct/min $2.40 $1.07 $1.10 - 500ct/min
MHMR Stress Ball EA $1.91 - 125c¢t/min $1.25 - 150ct/min $1.38 - 250ct/min $2.28 $1.40 $1.70 - 150ct/min
MH'\;';iltiozze:'a”d EA $1.35 - 150ct/min $1.47 - 200ct/min $1.29 - 250ct/min $1.47 $0.80 $.98 - 150ct/min
Non-Woven Grocery Tote . . .
Bag 15" Wx 15" Hx5' D A NO BID $1.69 - 150ct/min $1.25 - 100ct/min NO BID $2.75 $2.30 - 200ct/min
Tumbler Large EA $15.08 - 48ct/min $13.49 - 48ct/min $18.50 - 48ct/min NO BID $5.95-$7.05 $14.99 - 48ct/min
Tumbers Medium EA $12.22 - 48ct/min $13.49 - 48ct/min $11.75 - 48ct/min NO BID $6.79 $10.00 - 48ct/min
Die Cut Harl‘g!,e Bags-9x  pa $1.54 - 150ct/min $0.60 - 250ct/min $1.04 - 250ct/min $1.64 $0.57-$1.20 $.60 - 250ct/min
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Pens EA $0.73 - 300ct/min $1.98 - 200ct/min $0.65 - 500ct/min $0.70 $0.60-$0.80 $0.58 - 300ct/min
Drawstring Bag EA $3.95 - 100ct/min $1.70- 150ct/min Depe”gfazziizecs and $6.00 $0.95 $2.75 - 200ct/min
. Portiolio e $30.62 - 24ct/min $8.24 - 500ct/min $6.85 - 250ct/min NO BID $13.00-$14.00 $25.50 - 25¢t/min
Size: Approx: 6-1/2”x 9
Shipping: Included Not Included Included Not Included Not Included Included
Online Ordering
Does vend_or have a current online VES NO YES NO Yes, custom online Yes
portal, clients can place orders? portal can be created.
. . https://stores.fwcusto http://printnotify.com/ www.beofficesupply.c
Link to website m.com/ntmwd/shop/h NO Go.asp?L=L&P=4277 N/A Yes om
Describe how orders are placed N/A NO YES YES Yes YES

Opened by:

NEXT LOW:
LOW:
SAVINGS:

AWARD DATE:

"Bid Tabulation Statement"
All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be
construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive. MHMR
will make a determination as to the responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant
guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The Agency
will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.
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