
22nd Centry Technologies ABBA Staffing Ad-A Staff INC Aequor Healthcare Addidson Group A-Line Staffing

Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive

No Yes Yes No No No

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

30% 36%
(Admin) 35% (Health) 

38%
40--65%

(Most) 48% | (Only PC Tech) 
42% | (Only Various IT 

Support Roles) 45%

(Admin) 44% | (IT & 
Health) 45%

$26.00 $24.48 $30.82 $33.60 $35.52 $27.36 

$44.20 $40.48 $39.15 $43.40 $53.37 $40.32 

$26.00 $27.20 $32.40 $30.80 $39.55 $27.36 

$58.50 $34.00 $33.75 $35.00 $46.84 $37.44 

$32.50 $34.00 $34.83 $33.60 $39.96 $29.82 

$32.50 $40.80 $37.80 $39.20 $39.74 $40.32 

$32.50 $27.20 $28.35 $43.14 $27.36 

$26.00 $27.20 $29.70 $29.36 $25.92 

$26.00 $24.48 $24.30 n/a $29.00 

$28.60 $24.48 $24.30 $29.60 $29.00 

$91.00 $79.45 $90.00 $66.70 

$40.30 $31.90 $50.00 $27.55 

$117.00 $87.00 $90.00 $63.80 

$84.50 $65.25 $75.00 $58.00 

$94.90 $89.90 $90.00 $69.60 

$80.60 $72.50 $100.00 $72.50 

$91.00 $98.60 $105.00 $59.45 

$119.60 $92.50 $115.00 $72.50 

$104.00 $36.25 $55.00 $31.90 

$39.00 $27.60 $29.00 $23.20 

$36.40 $31.74 $31.20 $30.45 

$45.50 $41.40 $33.00 $27.55 

$65.00 $48.30 $54.25 $50.75 

$78.00 $69.00 $68.00 $62.35 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"

LOW:
All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on 

this sheet should not be
Yellow highlight = percentage does not match

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR

will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency

  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

No Bid

Paralegal

Assistants

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Original with copies

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Registered Nurse

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Staff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

No Bid

No Bid

% of Markup

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

No Bid

No Bid

CAN

LVN

Clerks

Various IT support roles

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst



American Unit Amergis Government Apple One Employment Bridgework Partner
Business Integra 

Technology Solutions
BuzzClan

Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Original Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase

Yes No Yes Yes No No

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

Yes

Yes

(Admin) 48% | (IT) 38% | 
(Health) 44%

(Most) 55% | (Only direct 
Care Staff, Medical Asst., 

and CNA) 60%
45%

(Admin) 55% | (IT) 58% | 
(Health Care) 60%

(Admin) 36% | (IT) 32% | 
(Health Care) 35%

$39.96 $35.65 $34.80 $32.16 $62.00 $31.28 

$41.44 $58.90 $46.40 $45.56 $74.40 $34.00 

$37.00 $35.65 $29--$31.90 $34.84 $58.90 $34.00 

$47.36 $54.25 $43.50 $45.56 $74.40 $43.52 

$32.56 $38.75 $31.90 $36.18 $77.50 $32.64 

$39.96 $57.35 $46.40 $40.20 $85.25 $32.64 

$32.56 $32.55 $29--$31.90 $42.88 $69.75 $31.92 

$31.08 $31.00 $29.00 $28.14 $55.80 $27.20 

$31.08 $34.10 $29.00 $26.80 $49.60 $24.48 

$31.08 $31.00 $26.10-$29 $26.80 $54.25 $24.48 

$77.28 $75.40 $88.32 $94.80 $92.40 

$51.06 $43.50 $69.00 $71.10 $39.60 

$128.34 $84.10 $89.70 $126.40 $98.00 

$99.36 $69.60 $67.62 $110.60 $85.08 

$103.50 $107.30 No Bid $123.24 $92.00 

$69.00 $98.60 $96.60 $102.70 $80.00 

$103.50 $101.50 $103.50 $118.50 $85.08 

$110.40 $107.30 No Bid $134.30 $85.08 

$110.40 $40.60--$46.40 TBD $110.60 $46.00 

$30.24 $35.20 $97.60 $27.00 

$36.00 $38.40 $83.20 $27.70 

$43.20 $36.80 $84.80 $29.08 

$46.08 $48.05 $88.00 $47.25 

$50.40 $71.30 $160.00 $64.08 

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

Assistants

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Cloud Engineer

Original with copies

LVN

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Staff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Project Manager

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

% of Markup

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CNA

Registered Nurse

Clerks

Various IT support roles

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

PC Tech



Cambay Consulting CCS Global Tech Codeforce 360 Cogent Infotech
Compu-Vision 

Consulting
Compunnel Software

Public Purchase Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive

Yes No No Yes Yes No

Yes W-9 Yes W-9 W-9 Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

Yes

39% (Admin) 40% | (IT) 42%
(Admin) 27% | (IT and 

Medical) 30%
(Admin and IT) 40% | 

(Health) 45%
42% 30%--37%

$38.92 $27.00 $35.56 $42.73 $45.00 $44.55 

$44.48 $35.00 $57.15 $68.18 $65.00 $36.45 

$36.14 $24.00 $31.75 $61.60 $55.00 $43.20 

$41.70 $31.00 $63.50 $53.20 $55.00 $31.05 

$38.92 $27.00 $44.45 $46.20 $52.00 $40.50 

$48.65 $31.00 $44.45 $49.00 $52.00 $27.00 

$40.31 $27.00 $29.21 $43.40 $45.00 $24.30 

$33.36 $22.00 $26.67 $33.60 $45.00 $21.60 

$29.19 $22.00 $26.67 $33.60 $42.00 $27.00 

$30.58 $25.00 $31.75 $37.80 $45.00 $33.75 

$67.42 $99.00 $84.50 $84.00 $99.00 $84.50 

$41.70 $43.00 $39.00 $56.00 $45.00 $45.50 

$86.60 $128.00 $97.50 $91.00 $115.00 $91.00 

$70.20 $71.00 $84.50 $81.20 $85.00 $78.00 

$80.62 $92.00 $97.50 $86.80 $104.00 $84.50 

$72.28 $114.00 $78.00 $78.40 $98.00 $91.00 

$91.05 $99.00 $97.50 $89.60 $104.00 $84.50 

$94.94 $125.00 $110.50 $92.40 $110.00 $104.00 

$39.75 $114.00 $58.50 n/a $60.00 $58.50 

$31.28 $32.50 $65.09 $35.00 $30.14 

$33.36 $36.40 $49.30 $39.00 $32.88 

$32.67 $58.50 $60.90 $44.00 $41.10 

$45.18 $78.00 $65.25 $56.00 $54.80 

$62.55 $110.50 $87.00 $85.00 $95.90 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Business Intelligence Developer

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Stff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Original with copies

No Bid

% of Markup

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

Clerks

Various IT support roles

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Registered Nurse

Security Analyst

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

Network Engineer



Cornerstone Medical Cornerstone Staffing Cross Country D.S. Technologies Dash Technologies Delta T Group

Original Original Original Original Original Original and Flash Drive

Yes Yes No Yes No No

W-9 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

No

Yes No

35% (Admin) 42% | (IT) 45%
(Admin and Various IT 

support roles only) 45% | 
(IT) 35% 

(Most) 30% | (Only 
Accounting Clerk) 25%

24%--65%

$25.56--$34.08 $37.50 $33.35 $31.25 $29.90 

$45.44--$59.64 $57.50 $46.40 $49.40 $40.25 

$28.40-$35.50 $35.00 $35.52 $36.40 $29.50 

$41.18--$51.12 $60.00 $50.75 $39.00 No Bid

$32.66--$38.34 $42.50 $39.15 $39.00 $29.00 

$40.41--$54.61 $57.50 $47.85 $52.00 No Bid

$22.72--$28.40 $35.00 $36.25 $33.75 $29.00 

$22.72--$28.40 $32.50 $29.00 $26.00 $23.75 

$22.72--$28.40 $30.00 $25.37 $26.00 No Bid

$24.14--$31.24 $32.50 $26.10 $32.50 $23.75 

$58.00--$72.50 $75.00 $89.10 $65.00 

$30.45--$44.95 $38.00 $43.20 $45.00 

$60.90--$75.40 $85.00 $101.25 $70.00 

$47.85--$62.35 $82.50 $94.50 $65.00 

$55.10--$76.85 $90.00 $99.90 $80.00 

$58.00--$79.75 $82.50 $87.75 $70.00 

$68.15--$82.65 $70.00 $97.20 $75.00 

$72.50--$101.50 $100.00 $108.00 $85.00 

$29.00--$58.00 $53.50 $43.50 $80.00 

$24.30--$27.00 $27.50 $78.00 $23.75 

$25.65--$31.05 $37.50 $84.50 $28.50 

$24.30--$29.70 $35.00 $58.50 $28.50 

$37.80--$45.90 $47.50 $58.50 $52.00 

$60.75--$67.50 $75.00 $71.50 $52.00 

$85.05--$90.45 n/a n/a

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

APRN

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

Registered Nurse

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Staff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

IT Positions

Security Analyst

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

No Bid

% of Markup

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

Assistants

CNA

LVN

Clerks

Various IT support roles

Couriers

Receptionists



Devfi Inc Eight Eleven Group Elite Corporate Solutions eNcloud Services Enterprise Global Exclusive Staffing

Original Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Public Purchase Public Purchase

Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

W-9 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

No

No

(Admin) 30% | (IT) 35% | 
(Health) 40%

50%--112% (Admin) 35% | (IT) 37%
(Admin & Health) 48% | 

(IT) 29%
(Admin) 38% | (Health) 

40%
(Admin) 35% | (IT and 

Health) 45%

$32.50 $57.60 $37.80 $25.49 $30.60 $33.75 

$49.40 $40.80 $47.25 $24.15 $41.40 $60.75 

$28.60 $44.55 $33.75 $28.45 $24.84 $33.75 

$39.00 $44.55 $60.75 $73.27 $44.16 $47.25 

$32.50 $39.00 $47.25 $32.53 $34.50 $40.50 

$36.40 $48.00 $40.50 $38.64 $44.16 $33.75 

$39.00 $27.20 $33.75 $35.36 $39.33 $27.00 

$28.60 $27.20 $27.00 $32.53 $25.53 $24.30 

$27.30 $29.83 $27.00 $26.46 $24.15 $21.60 

$23.40 $40.80 $27.00 $28.46 $24.84 $21.60 

$60.75 $131.12 $75.35 $83.97 $89.70 $72.50 

$37.80 $82.52 $43.84 $57.03 $52.44 $36.25 

$99.90 $144.24 $86.31 $109.92 $124.20 $69.60 

$87.75 $125.00 $75.35 $97.91 $89.70 $69.60 

$81.00 $104.50 $82.20 $100.97 $115.90 $79.75 

$78.30 $127.59 $75.35 $100.74 $89.70 $87.00 

$81.00 $104.50 $78.09 $105.75 $103.50 $65.25 

$87.75 $127.59 $89.05 $105.90 $107.64 $79.75 

$54.00 n/a $43.84 $113.67 $62.10 $36.25 

$75.60 $50.00 $67.93 $63.00 $23.20 

$81.20 $50.00 $77.09 $49.00 $26.10 

$72.80 $55.00 $71.20 $43.00 $31.90 

$53.20 $65.00 $87.48 $70.00 $43.50 

$89.60 $75.00 $90.41 $98.00 $69.60 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

Security Analyst

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Registered Nurse

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Staff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Original with copies

No Bid

% of Markup

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

Clerks

Various IT support roles

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions



Express Employment 
Professionals

Evolvers Fedtec Global Empire
GTS Technology 

Solutions
Hanker Systems

Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Public Purchase

Yes No Yes No No Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E Deviations A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

Yes

38 - 40% 45% 35% 30% 40% 28 - 30%

$23.76 - $29.04 $36.25 $40.50 $28.77 $35.00 $29.90 

$31.68 - $44.88 $58.00 $56.70 $51.99 $63.00 $40.30 

$23.76 - $36.96 $40.60 $37.80 $32.28 $35.00 $27.30 

$29.04 - $36.96 $55.10 $64.80 $47.23 $45.50 

$26.40 - $36.96 $39.15 $47.25 $28.43 $44.80 $35.10 

$29.04 - $43.56 $40.60 $66.15 $45.14 $48.10 

$22.44 - $31.68 $36.25 $31.05 $22.44 $32.20 $41.60 

$21.12 - $27.72 $33.35 $33.75 $20.12 $32.20 $41.60 

$21.12 - $23.76 $30.45 $31.05 $25.55 $28.60 

$21.12 - $26.40 $34.80 $33.75 $20.70 $32.20 $24.70 

$75.60 - $94.50 $101.50 $87.75 $67.13 $92.28 $101.12 

$28.35 - $39.15 $43.50 $44.55 $29.09 $39.20 $52.48 

$40.50 - $47.25 $101.50 $105.30 $88.92 $126.00 $99.84 

$40.50 - $47.25 $94.25 $87.75 $77.16 $85.35 $90.88 

$52.65 - $60.75 $101.50 $87.75 $71.18 $105.07 $102.40 

$43.20 - $51.30 $108.75 $81.00 $53.77 $86.35 $58.88 

$39.15 - $47.25 $101.50 $83.70 $76.87 $105.07 $101.12 

$60.75 - $67.50 $113.10 $87.75 $80.95 $106.05 $104.96 

$32.40 - $40.50 $65.25 $74.25 Seet attached prices sheet $48.64 

$43.50 $40.50 $15.86 $32.50 

$50.75 $40.50 $23.89 $37.70 

$47.85 $54.00 $22.91 $58.50 

$52.20 $60.75 $38.88 $55.90 

$75.40 $97.20 $54.68 $91.00 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

Registered Nurse

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

Accounting Clerk

Stff Accountant

Project Manager

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Clerks

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

PC Tech

Original with copies

No Bid

% of Markup

No Bid

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions



Health Advocate Network IFLOW Infojini Info Stride Info Way Solutions Isphere

Original Original Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive

No Yes Yes Yes No No

Yes W-9 Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

Yes Yes

(Admin) 33% | (IT) 39% | 
(Health) 38%

40% 35 - 50% 12 - 15% 30% 40%

$30.59 $44.80 $34.50 $20.94 $40.59 

$39.90 $63.00 $45.54 $25.42 $51.66 

$26.60 $49.00 $34.50 $28.00 $36.59 

$42.56 $50.40 $45.54 $25.98 $67.02 

$27.93 $56.00 $35.88 $25.98 $42.30 

$26.60 $77.00 $48.30 $46.26 $64.51 

$23.94 $56.00 $38.64 $24.64 $45.33 

$22.61 $42.00 $27.60 $20.24 $33.29 

$19.95 No Bid $23.46 $16.80 $32.01 

$21.28 $42.00 $27.60 $20.53 $33.38 

$94.47 $98.00 $106.26 $49.68 $107.30 $102.20 

$49.35 $53.20 $42.78 $34.50 $43.84 $36.40 

$80.37 $105.00 $117.30 $65.87 $85.61 $109.20 

$70.50 $84.00 $96.60 $48.30 $82.60 $88.20 

$112.80 $105.00 $96.60 $77.05 $102.28 $120.20 

$98.70 $102.20 $93.84 $74.75 $81.13 $95.20 

$84.60 $98.00 $96.60 $59.80 $71.83 $95.20 

$74.73 $105.00 $99.36 $60.95 $78.49 $95.20 

$42.30 $84.00 $62.10 $42.55 $59.43 $36.40 

$25.02 $33.00 $22.40 $53.66 

$41.70 $37.50 $27.78 $52.74 

$38.92 $45.00 $24.64 $56.45 

$69.50 $67.50 $35.28 $65.46 

$93.13 $82.50 $51.52 $98.38 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS:
construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as 

responsive.  MHMR
Yellow highlight = percentage does not match

will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant
AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency

  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

No Bid

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

No Bid

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Clerks

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Stff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

% of Markup

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

Registered Nurse

No Bid



Kforce Key Staff LanceSoft
Management Recruiters 

of Fort Worth
Marathon Staffing MGT Impact Solutions

Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Public Purchase Public Purchase Public Purchase

No Yes No Yes No No

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E Deviations A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

Yes

Not provided 32% 35% 50% 36% 50%

$39.87 $26.40 $34.76 $35.25 $26.18 $36.00 

$57.87 $36.96 $62.57 $48.78 $36.04 $52.50 

$39.87 $25.08 $34.76 $30.23 $26.04 $37.50 

$55.82 $30.36 $69.53 n/a $31.76 $43.50 

$45.19 $26.40 $44.50 $31.73 $30.60 $36.00 

$45.57 $34.32 $48.67 $41.28 $38.56 $57.00 

$39.54 $23.76 $31.98 $26.88 $25.19 $36.00 

$35.72 $23.76 $29.20 $24.08 $20.74 $30.00 

n/a n/a $26.42 $33.93 $24.14 $26.25 

$35.72 $23.76 $27.81 $30.60 $20.74 $33.00 

$75.25 $58.08 $90.38 $85.74 $59.09 $105.00 

$47.75 $30.36 $38.93 $30.65 $44.68 $60.00 

$74.50 $59.40 $60.75 $70.91 $57.53 $105.00 

$65.50 $50.16 $54.00 $64.71 $51.14 $90.00 

$75.25 $68.64 $90.38 $65.73 $76.11 $82.50 

$85.25 $68.64 $76.48 $75.29 $61.91 $97.50 

$78.95 $85.80 $83.43 $69.14 $52.82 $9.00 

$88.75 $92.40 $67.50 $89.84 $66.31 $97.50 

TBD TBD $35.10 $35.46 $36.88 $90 - $127.5

$27.81 $23.36 $22.10 

$33.37 $29.22 $27.34 

$45.89 $28.82 $29.31 

$49.95 $39.98 $46.72 

$87.60 $72.00 $56.10 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

No Bid

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Clerks

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Staff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

% of Markup

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

CAN

LVN

Registered Nurse

No BidNo Bid



Midtown Group N2S Global OMM IT Solutions Onin Staffing Patterns LLC Prisa Consulting Group

Original and Flash Drive Original Public Purchase Original Public Purchase Public Purchase

Yes Yes Yes No No Yes

Yes Yes Yes No W-9 Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

No No

Yes No No No Yes No

58% 30 - 40% 32% 29% 37 - 45% 38%

$31.60 $37.40 $28.38 $28.38 $27.55 $36.07 

$55.30 $40.80 $39.60 $52.89 $40.54 $49.57 

$28.44 $29.92 $33.00 $24.51 $36.66 $34.32 

$47.40 $47.60 $39.60 $30.96 $29.76 $52.36 

$31.60 $38.08 $35.64 $28.38 $30.15 $41.25 

$41.08 $48.96 $36.96 $30.96 $44.38 $42.17 

$47.40 $34.00 $30.36 $28.38 $22.98 $29.16 

$23.70 $29.24 $27.72 $19.35 $24.27 $30.26 

$25.28 $28.56 $26.40 $19.35 $28.58 $29.88 

$26.86 $27.20 $25.08 $19.35 $21.29 $30.83 

$63.20 $78.00 $46.20 $46.44 $63.62 $130.34 

$39.50 $39.00 $36.96 $47.73 $36.65 $58.43 

$86.90 $84.50 $81.84 $51.60 $71.24 $117.30 

$63.20 $65.00 $46.20 $46.44 $62.84 $117.30 

$79.00 $78.00 $68.04 $55.47 $76.00 $138.00 

$79.00 $65.00 $73.92 $55.47 $66.53 $117.30 

$94.80 $78.00 $73.92 $49.02 $83.22 $124.20 

$94.80 $84.50 $68.64 $58.05 $77.72 $124.20 

$34.76 - $126.40 $37.70 $48.84 $32.25 $54.94 $49.68 

$26.60 $25.08 $19.35 $36.65 $34.17 

$33.00 $29.04 $20.64 $58.03 $50.88 

$28.00 $33.00 $20.64 $44.14 $62.87 

$49.00 $35.60 $27.09 $62.84 $65.78 

$75.60 $66.00 $45.15 $95.90 $121.40 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"
LOW: All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Clerks

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Stff Accountant

HR Customer Service Rep

% of Markup

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

PC Tech

Project Manager

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

Registered Nurse

No Bid



Protouch Staffing Recruiting Source Inter Rose International SOAL Technologies
Software Professionals 

Inc
Supplemental Health

Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive Original and Flash Drive

Yes Yes No Yes Yes No

Yes W-9 Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes No Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

No No No

Yes Yes No

34% 142% 35% 42 - 55% 39% 28%

$26.80 $34.08 $28.35 $28.40 

$45.56 $58.22 $38.81 $42.00 

$22.78 $41.18 $32.06 $21.00 

$36.18 $58.22 $34.76 $26.74 

$26.80 $36.94 $32.06 $40.33 

$34.84 $59.64 $40.16 $31.24 

$40.20 $36.92 $29.36 $21.30 

$20.10 $29.82 $24.30 $21.30 

$21.44 $35.50 $24.30 $28.87 

$22.78 $32.66 $25.65 $19.88 

$53.60 $99.40 $64.13 $98.43 $90.35 

$32.16 $41.18 $32.40 $44.82 $55.60 

$80.40 $117.86 $70.88 $108.71 $97.30 

$72.36 $105.08 $64.13 $92.00 $83.40 

$62.32 $115.02 $77.63 $72.22 $100.80 

$83.08 $102.24 $70.88 $72.43 $97.30 

$71.02 $86.62 $77.63 $71.25 $100.80 

$96.48 $88.04 $84.38 $126.77 $107.30 

$44.22 $49.70 n/a $48.78 $55.60 

$26.80 $34.08 $22.55 n/a

$26.80 $34.08 $24.84 $38.00 

$26.80 $48.28 $37.83 $40.00 

$38.86 $48.28 $42.23 $55.00 

$64.32 $100.82 $65.15 $70.00 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW: "Bid Tabulation Statement"

LOW:
All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet.  However, the listing of a bid on 

this sheet should not be
Yellow highlight = percentage does not match

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant

AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency
  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

N o Bid

N o Bid

Registered Nurse

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CNA

LVN

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

PC Tech

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

Clerks

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

N o Bid

No BidNo Bid

% of Markup

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Stff Accountant

Project Manager

HR Customer Service Rep



Techgene Tech Smart Solutions vTech Healthcare
Worldwide Travel 

Staffing
Zentech Consulting

Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive Public Purchase Original and Flash Drive

Yes Yes Yes No No

W-9 Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E A,C,D,E

No

Yes

25% 20-40%
(Admin) 39% | (IT and most of 

Health) 40% | (Only LVN & 
Registered Nurse) 45%

40% 45%

$26.25 $42.33 $31.90 

$38.12 $60.47 $46.40 

$23.75 $38.29 $31.90 

$46.87 $58.38 $50.75 

$26.25 $40.31 $31.90 

$37.50 $53.71 $46.40 

$23.75 $39.50 $29.00 

$23.13 $36.70 $29.00 

$26.87 $25.80 $29.00 

$21.25 $38.71 $29.00 

15% | (Only for PC Tech and 
Various IT Support Roles) 
25%

40% 48%

$71.30 $85.00 $78.40 $76.96 

$24.29 $72.00 $30.80 $37.00 

$74.75 $85.00 $77.00 $81.40 

$69.00 $77.00 $60.20 $81.40 

$71.30 $95.00 $58.80 $59.20 

$69.00 $95.00 $50.40 $66.60 

$69.00 $90.00 $57.40 $59.20 

$69.00 $90.00 $70.00 $81.40 

$26.25 $70.00 $60.20 $37.00 

(Most) 40% | (Only LVN & 
Registered Nurse) 45%

50%

$30 - $34 $30.80 $43.80 $30.00 

$49 - $56 $38.50 $44.80 $33.00 

$25 - $31 $28.00 $44.80 $33.00 

$35 - $49 $47.85 $56.00 $60.00 

$56 - $68 $89.69 $76.00 $75.00 

Opened by:

NEXT LOW:
LOW:

SAVINGS: construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that MHMR accepts such bid as responsive.  MHMR
Yellow highlight = 

percentage does not match

will make a determination as to the  responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, MHMR Tarrant
AWARD DATE: guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The Agency

  will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.

PC Tech

No Bid

Registered Nurse

Business Analyst

Business Intelligence Developer

Network Engineer

Developer

Cloud Engineer

Various IT support roles

Health Care Positions

Direct Care Staff

Medical Assistants

CAN

LVN

% of Markup

Clerks

Couriers

Receptionists

IT Positions

Security Analyst

HR Customer Service Rep

Retirement and Benefits Liason

Accounts Receivable/Payable 
Coordinators

Paralegal

Assistants

RFP 25-008

Temporary Staffing Services
Thursday,February  27, 2025  2:00 p.m.

VENDOR

Specs/Requirements

Original with copies

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

% of Markup

% of Markup

HUB: Yes/No

Insurance and W-9

Acknowledgement

Attachments A, C, D, & E

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Admin Positions

Accounting Clerk

Staff Accountant

Project Manager


